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with handmade and unique items like jewelry, 
handbags, apparel, home décor and much more. 
Shop in the store or online at.  Hours: Mon.-Thur, 
10am-6pm; Fri.&Sat., 10am-8pm; and Sun., 
1-5pm. Contact: 336/274-2212 or at (www.
onlyjustbe.com). 

Greenville

City Art Gallery, 511 Red Banks Road, 
Greenville. Ongoing - The gallery features 
the works of established regional and national 
artists and craftspeople. The gallery offers an 
extensive collection of paintings, sculpture, 
ceramics, glass, drawings and photography. 
Hours: Mon.-Fri., 10am-6pm & Sat., 10am-4pm 
or by appt. Contact: 252/353-7000 or at (www.
CityArtGreenville.com).

Strickland Art Gallery, 817 Dickinson Ave., 
Greenville. Ongoing - The gallery specializes 
in art by North Carolina artists including Francis 
Speight, Sarah Blakeslee, Hobson Pittman and 
Claude Howell. Contemporary NC artists are also 
shown. Hours: Mon.-Tue., 10am-6pm and by 
appt. Contact: Barbour Strickland 252/561-7980 
or at (www.StricklandArtGallery.com).

Uptown Art Supply & Gallery, a division of 
UBE, 529 S Evans Street, Greenville. Ongoing - 
Featuring works in a variety of media by localand 
regional artists. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 9am-6pm and 
Sat., 10am-5pm. Contact: 252/752-0688 or at 
(www.uptownart.net).

Hendersonville - Flat Rock

Throughout Hendersonville/Flat Rock, Every 
3rd Fri. of the month, 5-8pm - "Art Gallery 
Trail WNC Hendersonville/Flat Rock Gallery 
Hop," featuring a tour of local galleries and art 
spaces, held May - Dec. For further info e-mail 
to (artgallerytrailwnc1@gmail.com).

Art MoB Studios & Marketplace, 124 4th 
Avenue East, Downtown Hendersonville just off 
of Main Street, Hendersonville. Ongoing - Art 
MoB now represents over 90 local artists and 
has been proudly open for three years, and 
counting. Art MoB also features 5,000 square 
feet of space including fours studios with 
wonderful resident artists. These artists can be 
found fast at work in their studios most days 
of the week. We invite you to come and join 
us... see our work, meet our artists, and take 
classes with us. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-5pm 
& Sun., 1-4:30pm. Contact: 828/693-4545 or at 
(www.artmobstudios.com).

Carolina Mountain Artists, 444 N. Main Street, 
Hendersonville. Ongoing - Featuring works by 
regional and local artists in every media. Hours: 
Mon.-Sat., 10am-6pm & Sun., 1-5pm. Contact: 
828/696-0707.

Custom Built Quilts, 411 N. Wall Street, Hen-
dersonville. Ongoing - Custom built quilts from 
aprons to wall hangings. Hours: open on week-
ends - call ahead to be sure. Contact: 828/808-
1567 or at (www.custombuiltquilts.com). 
 
East End Gallery on 7th Avenue, 518 7th 
Avenue East, Hendersonville. Ongoing - 
Featuring a unique collection of fine art and 
craft. Hours: Thur.-Sat., 11am-5pm. Contact: 
828/551-3278 or at (www.eastendgallery7.
com).

Firefly Craft Gallery, 2689-D Greenville 
Highway, Flat Rock. Ongoing - Featuring fine 
craft and art - all the little things that make 
living beautiful. Hours: Tue.-Sat., 10am-5pm. 
Contact: 828/231-0764 or at (www.fireflycraft-
gallery.com).

Framing Arts, 119 3rd Avenue West, Hender-
sonville. Ongoing - Framing Arts will elegantly 
frame all your artwork to fit your decor and 
budget. Using preservation techniques and 
archival materials, your art will be protected 
for a lifetime of enjoyment. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 
9:30am-5:30pm & Sat., 10am-5pm. Contact: 
828/696-3818 or at (www.framingarts.net).

McCarter Gallery, 451 N. Main St., Hender-
sonville. Ongoing - Featuring the working 
studio-gallery of landscape artist Alan McCa-
rter, specializing in his acrylic paintings of the 
beauty of Nature in the Blue Ridge and Great 
Smoky Mountains. Also, featuring a display 
of new works monthly. And, watercolors and 
acrylics of Robbin McCarter and art glass by 
Czech glass master Igor Muller and Canadian 
Robert Held. Hours Mon.-Sat.,10:30am-5:30pm 
& by appt. Contact: 828/698-7117 or at (www.
mccarter-gallery.com).

Narnia Studios, 315 N. Main St., Henderson-
ville. Ongoing - Featuring works by local and 

regional artists in a variety of media. Hours: 
Mon.-Sat., 9:30am-6pm. Contact: 828/697-
6393 or at (www.narniastudios.com).

Silver Fox Gallery, 508 N. Main Street, Hen-
dersonville. Ongoing - Featuring contemporary 
fine art, hand-crafted artworks from the US 
only, from primarily regional artists. And, now 
Home Furnishings. Hours: Mon.-Thur., 10am-
6pm; Fri.,10am-7pm; Sat., 10am-6pm; Sun., 
noon-5pm. Contact: 828/698-0601 or at (www.
silverfoxonline.com).

The Art House Gallery and Studio, 5 High-
land Park Road, East Flat Rock. Ongoing 
- Fine art gallery and private party venue featur-
ing works by Susan Johnston-Olivari and other 
local artists. Hours: by appt. only. Contact: 
828/808-3594 or at (www.arthousegalleryand-
studio.com).

The Portrait Source, Hwy. 225 S., along "Little 
Rainbow Row", Flat Rock. Ongoing - Repre-
senting the nation's finest portrait artists and we 
help clients find the perfect artist for both fami-
lies and the corporate world. We have expert 
sales consultants throughout the country. Visit 
our unique gallery where we have a continuing 
display of sample paintings. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 
10am-4pm or by appt. Contact 800/586-6575 
or at (www.theportraitsource.com).

High Point

J.Gallery at JH Adams Inn, 1108 North Main 
Street, High Point. Ongoing - Featuring works 
by artists from across the country with an 
emphasis on North Carolina artists. Hours: 
Mon.-Fri., 9am-5pm, but it is suggested you 
make an appointment. Contact: Julie Delgaudio 
at 336/8478672 or by e-mail at (phonefrnzy@
aol.com).

JK Gallery, 342 North Wrenn Street, High 
Point. Ongoing - Featuring fine art photog-
raphy by Jim Koch. Exhibiting black & white 
original silver gelatin prints and interpretations 
of color, architectural images, landscapes and 
portraits. Hours: M.-F., 9am-5pm. Contact: 
336/883-2370 or at (http://www.jk-gallery.com/). 
 
Kelly Brooke Pottery & Gallery, 709 W. 
Lexington Ave., inside of DeBeen Espresso, 
High Point. Ongoing - All of my work is wheel 
thrown and/or hand built from a porcelain clay 
body made right here in North Carolina. I use a 
centuries old style of surface decoration known 
as sprigging where I individually apply hand 
carved dragonflies or flowers to the leather 
hardened pots. Choose from mugs, bowls, 
vases, honey pots, teapots, plates, platters, etc. 
All of the pottery is food safe, microwave, and 
dishwasher safe and very durable. Hours: daily 
8am-8pm. Contact: 336/889-2107 or at (www.
kellybrookepottery.com).

Hillsborough

Callaway Jewelry & Spiral Studios, 115 North 
Churton Street, Hillsborough. Ongoing - Offer-
ing beautiful handmade jewelry in sterling silver 
and gold by metalsmiths/designers Catharine 
Callaway and Jeannine Rogers. Hours: Mon.-
Fri., 10am-6pm & Sat., 10am-4pm. Contact: 
919/732-2013 or at (http://www.sterlingspirals.
com/).

ENO Gallery, 100 South Churton Street, 
Hillsborough. Ongoing - The gallery repre-
sents exceptional contemporary emerging and 
established artists for both first time buyers and 
discerning collectors. Eno Gallery is a unique 
and intimate exhibition space. We offer work 
from artists of exceptional quality and dedica-
tion. Representing some of the most creative 
individuals from regional and national commu-
nities. Hours: Tue.-Thur., noon-6pm & Fri.-Sat., 
noon-8pm. Contact: 919/833-1415 or at (http://
www.enogallery.net/).

Hillsborough Artists Cooperative and The 
Skylight Gallery, 102 West King Street, up-
stairs over Antonia’s Restaurant, Hillsborough. 
Ongoing - Founded in 1992, featuring works 
by Jayne Bomberg and Tom Guthrie (The 
Studio of Collective Effervescence); Jennifer 
E. Miller, Andrea DeGette, Jacquelin Liggins, 
and Tiffney Marley. Hours: last Fri. of the month 
from 6-9pm or by appt. Contact: 919/929-2691 
or 919/644-8637.

Hillsborough Gallery of Arts, 121 N. Churton 
St., Suite 1-D, Hillsborough. Through Aug. 
21 - "Colorful Language," featuring jewelry 
by Nell Chandler, fiber art by Ali Givens, and 
paintings by Michele Yellin. Aug. 22 - Sept. 25 
- "Dreaming in Color ," featuring works by Alice 
Levinson, Pringle Teeter, and Lolette Guthrie. A 
reception will be held on Aug. 26, from 6-9pm. 

Ongoing - Founded in 2006, the gallery is 
owned by 22 artists and features painting, 
sculpture, photography, glass art, jewelry, 
turned wood, handcrafted furniture, pottery, 
mosaics & fiber art. Hours: 10am-6pm, Mon.-
Thur.; 10am-8pm, Fri. & Sat.; and noon-4pm, 
Sun. Contact: 919/732-5001 or at 
(www.HillsboroughGallery.com).

Sovero Art Gallery & Studio, 121 North Chur-
ton Street, Suite 2-B, Hillsborough. Ongoing - 
Featuring jewelry and oil paintings by Peruvian 
artist David Sovero, who was born in 1971 in 
Lima, Peru. He graduated from the Peruvian 
National Arts College where he attended from 
1990 -1996. He has a strong academic founda-
tion. His Incan ancestral roots are saturated 
with thousands of years of Andean stylized 
figures. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-7pm. Contact: 
919/619-5616 or at (http://soveroart.com/).

Lenoir

Morning Song Gallery, at old Victorian house, 
512 West Avenue, NW, across from the Lenoir 
Post Office and to the right of Baker Realty, 
Lenoir. Ongoing - Featuring works by local and 
regional artists. Hours: Call ahead. Contact: 
Margaret Carter Martine at 828/754-5693.

Lexington

The Bob Timberlake Gallery, 1714 E. Center 
Street Extension, Lexington. Ongoing - Featur-
ing original artwork and reproductions by Bob 
Timberlake.  Also furniture, gifts, apparel and 
collectibles. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-5pm. 
Contact: 800-244-0095 or at (www.bobtimber-
lake.com).

Lincolnton

Gallery 27, 808 W. Hwy. 27, Lincolnton, NC. 
Through Aug. 10 - "The Artistic Exploits of Triple 
J and R".Long time Gallery 27 members Jason 
Reynolds, Jane Newsom Reynolds, Jenna Web 
and Robert Webb will be showing an eclectic 
selection of paintings and mixed media art. The 
show is a true marriage of art, craft and just a 
dash of whimsy. Ongoing - The gallery is the 
area’s only working art gallery specializing in 
representing new and emerging artists. We also 
represents established artists. The space houses 
a formal fine art gallery, gift shop, and large 
classroom area. Hours: Wed.-Fri., 11am-6pm, 
and Sat., 9am-2pm. Contact: 704/240-9060 or at 
(www.ncgallery27.com).

Linville/Linville Falls Area

Anvil Arts Studio & Sculpture Gardens, Hwy. 
221, Linville Falls. Ongoing - While in Linville 
Falls, be sure to come by and stroll through the 
gallery, studio, and sculpture gardens of artist 
Bill Brown. His works include contemporary 
sculpture, sculptural lighting, and paintings. 
Youíll be drawn into each piece of art as it ap-
peals to your understanding from a myriad of 
materials including steel, copper, bronze, and 
various patinas. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 9am-5pm 
should call ahead at 828-765-6226 or at (www.
studiosculpture.com).

87 Ruffin Street Gallery, located next to the Old 
Hampton General Store and Barbeque, Hwy. 
221 in Linville. Ongoing - The gallery features 
the work of local and regional folk artists, potters, 
figural wood carvers, glass artists and painters. 
This unique gallery also carries beautiful furniture 
handcrafted by local artists from local woods. 
The gallery has its own framing shop for all your 
picture framing needs. Whether you are looking 
for original artwork for you home or for a gift 
Ruffin Street gallery is the perfect destination. 
Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-5pm & Sun., 11am-5pm. 
Contact: 828/737-0420 or at (www.ruffinstreetart-
gallery.com).
 

Mars Hill

Tom Turner Porcelain, 381 Turner Lane, Mars 
Hill. Ongoing - Featuring wheel thrown and 
high fired porcelain art pottery by Tom Turner 
with classical glazes like copper red oxblood, 
oilspot, celadons, and ash glazes. Hours: by 
appt. Contact: 828/689-9430 or at (www.tom-
turnerporcelain.com).
 

Marshall

East Fork Pottery, 268 Ras Grooms Road, 
Marshall. Ongoing - East Fork Pottery was 
founder in 2010 by Alexander Matisse. We 
make a full range of functional and sculptural 
ceramics, fired in a large wood bruning kiln, 
Striving to understand our place in the tapestry 
of American ceramics, we hold the past, pres-
ent, and future on equal ground, for the three in 
concert make the most beautifu chord. Hours: 
by appointment. Contact: 828/689-4109 or at 
(www.eastforkpottery.com).

Firewalker Gallery, Main St., across from the 
Madison County courthouse, Marshall. Ongo-
ing - The gallery features artists from Madison 
County and east Tenn. who work in a variety 
of mediums. Hours: Thur., Fri. & Sat., 10am-6-
pm and by appt. Contact: 828/649-0134 or at 
(www.firewalkergallery.com).
 

Mebane

Fine Art Carolina Gallery, 116 West Clay 
St., Mebane. Ongoing - The gallery offers 
traditional and contemporary art in various me-
diums. The gallery will also feature guest artists 
and offer art workshops. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 
11am-5pm. Contact: 919/455-5965 or at (http://
FineArtCarolina.com).

Micaville

Crabtree Creek Art and Floral Gallery, 4161 
E. Hwy 19-E, between Burnsville & Spruce 
Pine, in Micaville. Ongoing - A 2,400 sq. ft. 
gallery offering pottery, blown glass, paint-
ings, stained glass, wood carvings and bowls, 
jewelry, handmade handbags, sweaters & 
hats, Christmas trees, ornaments and holiday 
decorations, metal sculptures and ironwork, 
handmade soaps and lotions, fragrances and 
candles, wildlife & floral photography, home ac-
cessories, lamps, handmade tables, chairs and 
home accents, silk floral creations and fresh 
floral arrangements, textile pieces, handmade 
baskets and local crafts from the western North 
Carolina region. Also a complete garden center 
with blooming plants, hanging baskets, dish 
and herb gardens is located on property includ-
ing landscape art, hardscape and fountains. 
Hours: Tue.-Sat., 10am-5pm. Contact: 828/675-
0612 or at (www.crabtreecreekgallery.com). 
 
Crimson Laurel Gallery, inside Appalachian 
Terroir, 621 Micaville Loop, Micaville. Ongo-
ing - Appalachian Terroir is comprised of three 
divisions: Crimson Laurel Gallery, a studio 
ceramics retailer; Smoky Mountain Pottery 
Studio, a ceramics manufacturer; and Appala-
chian Terroir, designer and producer of original 
dinnerware and housewares. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 
8am-5pm & Sat., 10am-6pm. Contact: call Ben 
Philips at 904/716-3116 or e-mail to (contact@
crimsonlaurelgallery.com).  

Morehead City

BluSail Gallery, Artists’ School & Pottery 
Studio, 903 Arendell Street, downtown art 
district, Morehead City. Ongoing - The gallery 
represents and exhibits work by over 30 local 
artists. The Artists’ School and Pottery Studio 
are working studios designed to educate and 
enhance local talent for children and adults of 
all ages and all levels of experience. Hours: 
Mon.-Sat., 10am-5:30 or by chance. Contact: 
252/723-9516 or at (www.blu-sail.com).

Budding Artists, Ltd., 3000 Arendell Street, 
Unit 9, Morehead City. Ongoing - The gallery 
provides custom framing and artist liaisons for 
commissioned pieces. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-
6pm. Contact: 252/247-5111.

Carteret Contemporary Art, 1106 Arendell St., 
Morehead City. Ongoing - Featuring original 
paintings and sculpture from regional and 
national artists, and shows with gallery artists 
during spring and summer. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 
10am- 5pm and Sat., 10am-4pm. Contact 
252/726-4071 or at (www.twogalleries.net). 
 
Morehead City Photography Gallery, 1300 
E Arendell Street, Morehead City. Ongoing - 
The gallery showcases the  personal work of 
Mike Basher with a collection of limited edition 
black and white silver prints–images gath-
ered alongside his fifteen-year career as an 
advertising and editorial photographer. A recent 
transplant to the Beaufort/Morehead City area, 
his collection consists of serene photographs 
of beautiful local coastal scenes, and diverse 

Work by Alice Levinson

http://www.HillsboroughGallery.com/

