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lets in contemporary designs for all occasions. 
The show is the perfect time before the rush of 
the holidays to find special and thoughtful gifts 
or indulge in a personal shopping experience 
with your friends. Designers will be on hand to 
assist you in creating your own look, offering 
top trends and style advice. Ongoing - A fine 
art gallery dedicated to promoting regional 
and national artists; bringing awareness and 
appreciation of fine art to the community 
through exhibits, shows, demonstrations and 
by providing fine art to established and new art 
lovers. We offer a diverse selection of styles, 
subject matter and mediums including paint-
ings, pottery, ceramics, sculpture, photography, 
and jewelry. Hours: Mon.-Fri. 10am-6pm & Sat., 
10am -5pm. Contact: 252/634-9002 or at 
(www.fineartatbaxters.com).

The Art Gallery @ Le Bistro & Fine Dining, 
3402-B Trent Road, New Bern. Ongoing - Fea-
turing works by local artists who explore a wide 
range of media including Gayle George, Nell 
Maha, John Dreas, Nada Behr, Doris Walker, 
Barbara Cornish, B. Chris Munyan, Douglas 
Rowe, Tess Luper, James King, William K. 
Henson, John Mitchell, Joan Russell, Betty 
Brown, Blain Kruger and Dan Wilson. Come in 
for lunch or dinner, have a glass of wine and 
peruse the work of these fine artists. Hours: 
Tue.-Wed., 10am-5pm; Thur.-Sat., 10am-8pm; 
and Sun., 9am-2pm. Contact: 252/637-7331 or 
at (http://www.lebistrofinediningandtheartgal-
lery.com).

Ocracoke Island 

Village Craftsmen, 170 Howard Street, Oc-
racoke Island. Ongoing - We feature pottery, 
glass, jewelry, kitchen items, musical instru-
ments, wrought iron, baskets, bells, boxes, 
soaps, accessories, clothes, games, kaleido-
scopes, lawn sprinklers, lamps & lampshades, 
prints, tin ware, pewter items, tiles and much 
more - all made by American artists. Hours: 
Mon.-Sat., 10am-4pm & Sun., 10am-2pm. 
Contact: 252-928-5541 or at (www.villagecrafts-
men.com).

Old Fort 

Midland Crafters, 2220 Midland Rd., Pine-
hurst. Ongoing - Featuring the finest in Ameri-
can traditionl and contemporary hand crafts. 
The gallery carries something for everyone. 
Hours: Mon.-Sat., 9:30am-5:30pm & Sun., 
2-5pm. Contact: 910/295-6156.

Pittsboro

Davenport and Winkleperry, 18 E. Salisbury 
St., Suite A, Pittsboro. Ongoing - Imagine a 
space filled with art, designer toys, books, and 
an in-house seamstress. Impossible? Take a 
turn about downtown Pittsboro and you will 
stumble upon Davenport & Winkleperry, a 
gallery and retail space that offers all those 
extraordinary things along with other amusing 
oddities for your purchase, most with a hint of 
the Victorian aesthetic. Tucked on shelves you 
will find action figures of Oscar Wilde, tomes of 
Jules Verne, vintage gasmasks, one-of-a-kind 
jewelry, fantastical sweets and more. Even the 
mannequins are a treat to look at, dressed fine-
ly in the waistcoats and bustles skirts made by 
the in-house seamstress. The art on the walls 
changes every month showcasing the works of 
creative people from around the globe. Hours: 
Tue.-Sat., 11am-7pm. Contact: 919/533-6178 
or at (www.davenportandwinkleperry.com).

Liquid Ambar Gallery, 80 Hillsborough Street, 
Pittsboro. Ongoing - The retail store that carries 
one-of-a-kind artwork and we will have featured 
artists each month in the front gallery. Hours: 
Tue.-Fri., 10:30am-5:30pm; Sat., 9:30am-5-
:30pm; and Sun. 11am-4pm. Contact: 919/542-
1773.

The Joyful Jewel, 44-A Hillsborough2 Street, 
Pittsboro. Ongoing - Featuring local art fresh 
from the Heart. Mariah Wheeler is shoppe keeper 
at this gallery/gift store in  downtown Pittsboro. 
We feature exquisite art and gifts from over ninety 
local artists, with a price range to suit your bud-
get. You will find baskets, books, jewelry, cards, 
paintings, photography, sculpture, from glass, 
wood, clay, fiber, and more. On Fri. evenings 
the gallery features local musicians, poets, and 
other performance art with a wide array of talent. 
Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10:30am-5:30pm & Sun., 
noon-4pm. Contact: 919/883-2775 or at (www.
joyfuljewel.com).

Raleigh Area

Adam Cave Fine Art, 115 1/2 East Hargett St., 
half a block from Moore Square, Raleigh. On-
going - Representing a select group of regional 
and nationally known artists, including Joseph 
Cave, David Hewson, Stephen Aubuchon, 
Wayne Taylor, and Donald Furst. The gallery 
will also be introducing some new, young talent 
to the area, including Massachusetts painter 
Jennifer O’Connell. Hours: Tue.-Sat., 11am-
5pm & by appt. Contact: 919/272-5958 or at 
(www.adamcavefineart.com).

Artcraft Gallery, 406 W Hillsborough Street, 
Raleigh. Ongoing - Funky, functional and fine 
art by several co-op artists. Hours: Mon.-Thur., 
9am-5pm; Fri., 9am-1pm & 1st Fri., 6pm-
midnight. Contact: 919/832-5058 or at (www.
artcraftsignco.com).

New Location
ArtSource Fine Art & Framing, 4351 The 
Circle at North Hills Street, Suite 107, Raleigh. 
Nov. 14, 7-9pm - "Annual Holiday Showcase," 
will feature new works from all of ArtSource’s 
artists. Come meet your favorite artist while 
preparing for the holiday season with ‘gift-sized’ 
fine art pieces. Ongoing - Featuring fine art 
paintings, prints, and sculpture by NC, South-
eastern and national artists. Select from over 
1,600 original works of art. Also, offering art 
consulting services, corporate installations, and 
custom framing. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-6pm; 
Sun., 1-5pm; or by appt. Contact: 919/787-
9533 or at (www.artsource-raleigh.com).

Ashley’s Art Gallery,701 N. Main St,  located 
12 miles south of Raleigh, Fuquay-Varina. 
Ongoing - Featuring fine art originals by 
national and local artist including Terry Isaac, 
Braldt Bralds and John Weiss and reproduc-
tions by Pino, Robert Bateman, Carl Brenders, 
Bev Doolittle and William Mangum. Hours: 
Mon.-Thur., 11am-6pm & Fri.-Sat. 10:30am-5-
pm. Contact: 919/552-7533 ext.3 or at (www.
ashleyart.com).

Flanders Art Gallery, 302 S. West Street, 
Raleigh. Ongoing - Featuring a fine art gal-
lery dedicated to the promotion of national 
and international artists, providing fine art to 
established and new collectors, and catering to 
special events in support of fine art. We offer 
sculpture, painting, photography, illustrations, 
engravings, and other works on paper by 

emerging and established artists in a range 
of styles. Also offering art appraisal by an ISA 
educated appraiser and art consultation. Hours: 
Wed.-Sat.,11am-6pm. Contact: 919/834-5044 
or at (www.flandersartgallery.com). 

Gallery C, 540 North Blount Street, Raleigh. 
Nov. 1 - 30 - "Pablo Picasso: Original Etchings 
& Lithographs from 1927 – 1964". A recep-
tion will be held on Nov. 1, from 6-9pm. Pablo 
Picasso is known to be the greatest painter and 
most innovative sculptor of the 20th century; he 
was also its foremost printmaker. Hours: Tue.-
Sat., noon-6pm; Sun., 1-5pm, or by appt. Con-
tact: 919/828-3165 or at (www.galleryc.net).

Glenwood Gallery Art & Antiques, 610 W. 
Johnson St., Raleigh. Ongoing - Featuring 
works by Edwin D. Alexander, Barbara Evans, 
Michael Manas, Nancee Clark, Michael Van 
Horn, Rob Cox, Jim Green, Stan Strikland, 
Mark Tomczyk. Hours: Call. Contact: 919/829-
7202.

Grace Li Wang Art Gallery, Millbrook Lake 
Center, 2411 - 112 E. Millbrook Rd., Raleigh. 
Ongoing - Featuring landscapes, figures, 
abstracts, Chinese art, still lifes, and nature 
scenes by Grace Li Wang and other artists. 
Hours: by appt. Contact: 919/8721-5800 or at 
(www.graceliwang.com).

Lee Hansley Gallery, 225 Glenwood Ave., 
Raleigh. Ongoing - "NC Masters," featuring 
works by prominent deceased NC artists in-
cluding George Bireline, Edith London, Francis 
Speight and Joe Cox. There are 35 artists in 
the gallery’s stable whose works are shown 
on a rotating basis. The gallery also mounts 
invitational exhibitions in which non-gallery 
artists show alongside stable artists. The gal-
lery organizes at least one historical exhibition 
annually exploring the work of a single artist or 
group of stylistically related artists. Hours: Tue.-
Sat., 11am-6pm & 1st Fri. till 10pm. Contact: 
919/828-7557 or at (www.leehansleygallery.
com). 
 
Litmus Gallery & Studios, 312 W. Cabarrus 
Street, (across the tracks from Amtrak Train 
Station) Raleigh. Nov. 1 - 6 - "ANYTHING 
GOES 2013". Receptions will be held on Nov. 
1 & 6, fro, 6-9pm. Attendees at the Nov. 1 
opening reception will determine the “People’s 
Choice Award” by voting for their favorite works 
of art. This exhibit contains the works of over 
35 artists and will showcase an outstand-
ing range of original visual art in traditional, 
contemporary, and avant-garde creations. It 
provides a range of varying treatments that 
challenge traditional practices of visual art and 
incorporates varied media such as paintings, 
photography, sculpture, and mixed media. 
Ongoing - Regional emerging and/or estab-
lished artists are featured every month with a 
reception from 6-9pm the first Friday of each 
month. Studios of resident artists are open for 
touring, viewing, and selling of art (paintings, 
sketches, sculptures, pottery, mixed media, 
photography, etc.). Hours: Sat., 10am-2pm or 
by appt. Contact: 919/571-3605 or at (www.
litmusgallery.com).

Local Color Gallery, Carter Building, 22 South 
Glenwood Ave., Raleigh. Ongoing - The gallery 
has now grown into a women’s artist coopera-
tive 13 members strong. Hours: Thur., Fri., & 
Sat., 11am-3pm. Contact: 919/754-3887 or at 
(www.localcoloraleigh.com).

Nicole's Studio & Art Gallery, 719 N. Person 
St., Raleigh. Ongoing - The gallery represents 
local and nationally recognized artists in all 
genre specializing in excellence in Contem-
porary Realism. Up to 20 artists represented 
include; Rick McClure, Lori Putnam, Dawn 
Whitelaw, Nicole Kennedy, Kim Maselli, Dan 
Nelson. Hours: Tue.-Fri., 10:30am-5pm; Sat., 
noon-4:30pm; and 1st Fri., till 8:30pm. Contact: 
919/838-8580 or at (www.nicolestudio.com). 

Roundabout Art Collective, 305 Oberlin 
Road, Raleigh. Ongoing - Bringing together 
a diverse group of Wake County artists who 
have created a magnet location for exhibiting 
and selling art. Hours: Wed.- Sat., 11am-5pm 
& Sun., 1-5pm. Contact: 919/747-9495 or at 
(www.roundaboutartcollective.com).

The Collectors Gallery, The Pavilions at City 
Plaza, 443 Fayetteville St., Raleigh. Ongoing 
- Featuring a full service fine art and fine craft 
gallery, providing residential and commercial 
consulting and custom conservation fram-
ing. Representing over 60 national, regional 
and North Carolina artists, the gallery offers 
paintings, etchings, photography, sculpture, 
pottery and glass. Hours: Tue.-Sat., 10am-6pm; 
Sun., noon-4pm; & 1st. Fri, until 9pm Contact: 
919/828-6500 or at (www.thecollectorsgallery.
com). 

The Mahler Fine Art, Mahler Building, 228 
Fayetteville St., Raleigh. Ongoing - Featuring 
a dynamic venue dedicated to significant art 

of our time, committed to offering the best in 
regional and national fine art by emerging and 
established artists. Hours: Tue.-Fri., 11am-5pm; 
Sat., noon-4pm Contact: 919/828-6500 or at 
(www.themahlerfineart.com).

311 - Martin St Gallery and Studios, 311 Mar-
tin Street, Warehouse District, Raleigh. Ongo-
ing - Featuring three exhibit galleries, studios 
by tenant artists, The Print Studio, and the 
meeting place for The North Carolina Printmak-
ers. Hours: Tue.-Sat., 11am-6pm and 6-9pm on 
1st Friday of the month. Contact: 919/821-2262 
or at (www.311galleriesandstudios.org). 
 
Tipping Paint Gallery, 428 S. McDowell 
Street, Raleigh. Ongoing - The gallery is a 
group of artists that have worked together since 
2009 planning and hanging exhibits, marketing, 
community outreach, and supporting and en-
couraging each other in our artistic endeavors. 
In 2011, the group found a great location in the 
heart of downtown Raleigh where we opened 
Tipping Paint Gallery in June. Our mission is 
two-fold: to exhibit quality art on a year-round 
basis and to continue to strive for personal 
artistic growth. Hours: Thur., 11am-3pm; Fri., 
11am-3pm & 5-8pm; Sat., noon-8pm or by 
appt. Contact: 919/928-5279.

     ALTERNATE ART SPACES - Raleigh
Bloomsbury Bistro, 509 W. Whitaker Mill 
Rd., Suite 101, Raleigh. Ongoing - Featuring 
an exhibition of works from ArtSource Fine Art 
Gallery, featuring works by Ted Jaslow, Cher 
Cosper, James Kerr, Jim Chapman, Mary Page 
Whitley, and more. All works are available 
for purchase. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 5:30-10pm. 
Contact: call ArtSource at 919/787-9533 or at 
(www.artsource-raleigh.com).The Bistro at: 
919834-9011 or e-mail at (bloomsburybistro@
nc.rr.com).

Restaurant Savannah, 4351 The Circle at 
North Hills Street, Suite 119, Raleigh. Ongo-
ing - Featuring works by artists from ArtSource 
Fine Art Gallery, including works by Ted Jaslow, 
Mandy Johnson, James Kerr, Charlotte Foust, 
Margo Balcerek, Brian Hibbard, Caroline 
Jasper, and more. All works are available for 
purchase. Hours: Mon.-Fri., open at 11am; 
Sat., open at 5;30pm & Sun., open at 10pm. 
Contact: 919/787-9533 or at 
(www.artsource-raleigh.com).

Randleman

Work by Maggie Jones
Turtle Island Pottery, 2782 Bat Cave Road, 
Old Fort. Ongoing - Featuring handmade pot-
tery by Maggie and Freeman Jones, who cre-
ate one of a kind, functional, decorative stone-
ware items. From cups to umbrella stands, mir-
ror frames and clocks. Sculptural and inspired 
by nature, many forms are reminiscent of 
antique pottery from the arts and crafts move-
ment and art nouveau styles. Hours: Showroom 
open most Saturdays, call ahead for any day of 
the week. Contact: 828/669-2713 or at 
(www.Turtleislandpottery.com).

Pinehurst - Southern Pines Area 

Artist Alley, 167 E. New Hampshire Ave., 
Southern Pines. Ongoing - Featuring a 
wide variety of affordable artwork and fine 
crafts made exclusively here in North Caro-
lina. Hours: Mon.-Sat., 11am-5pm. Contact: 
910/692-6077.

Broadhurst Gallery, 2212 Midland Rd., 
Pinehurst. Ongoing - Featuring works by re-
gional, national and international artists. Hours: 
Tue.-Fri., 11am-5pm & Sat., 1-4pm. Contact: 
910/295-4817 or at (www.broadhurstgallery.
com).

Hollyhocks Art Gallery, 905 Linden Rd., one 
mile from Pinehurst next to Elliott’s restaurant, 
Pinehurst. Ongoing - Featuring original work 
by award winning local artists Jane Casnel-
lie, Diane Kraudelt, Irene McFarland, Paula 
Montgomery, and Robert Gera. Offering a wide 
range of work from contemporary to traditional, 
the gallery includes portraiture, vibrant Tuscan 
scenes, palpable pet portraits, beautiful florals 
and more, in a wide variety of mediums includ-
ing oils, acrylics, pastels and unusual black and 
white washes. Hours: Mon.-Sat.,10am-9:30pm. 
Contact: 910/255-0665 or at (www.Hollyhock-
sArtGallery.com).

Work by Joseph Sand
Joseph Sand Pottery, 2555 George York 
Road, Randleman. Ongoing - Featuring wood-
fired, salt and ash glazed pottery by Joseph 
Sand at kiln openings held three times each 
year. Hours: by appt. only. Contact: 612/518-
4051 or 336/460-0259 and at (http://www.
jsspottery.com/).

Rutherfordton

Ornamentals and Finer Welding, Inc., 
142 West Court St., Rutherfordton. Ongo-
ing - Featuring works by master artisan Tom 
Elfers. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 9am-5pm and Sat., 
10am-5pm. Contact: 828/288-3001 or at (www.
ornametals1.com).

Salisbury - Spencer

Throughout Salisbury & Spencer, Nov. 9, 
from 1-5pm - "Second Saturday Art Crawl," 
where more than 20 professional artists, stu-
dios and galleries offer visitors new art, special 
events, and activities. Spend the day and see 
great art, talk to artists, hear live music, and 
dine at local restaurants. Free admission to all 
events and activities. Maps are available at the 
Visitor Center in Salisbury and at all participat-
ing venues. Free parking available in all loca-
tions. For more info call 704/638-9887 or visit 
(www.rowanartcrawl.com).

Green Goat Gallery, 516 S. Salisbury Ave., 
just off I-85, across from the North Carolina 
Transportation Museum, Spencer. Ongoing 
- Housed in the historic 20th century Sands 
Building, the gallery features fine and folk art, 
photography, exquisite handcrafted functional 
crafts and jewelry, and eclectic recycled and 
found art by local, regional, and national 
artists. Hours: Tue.-Sat., 10:30am -5:30pm. 
Contact: 704/639-0606 or at (www.greengoat-
gallery.com). 
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