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Gallery Director at 864/656-3883 or at (http://
www.clemson.edu/centers-institutes/cva/galler-
ies/index.html).

Dean’s Suite Gallery, Clemson University, 108 
Strode Tower, 121 Delta Epsilon Ct., Clemson. 
Through Nov. 12 - "Diverso: Drawings From 
Italy". This exhibition is showcase of draw-
ings from the sketchbooks of four graduate 
students, created on-site from various locations 
throughout Italy during the Department of Art’s 
summer study abroad program. The exhibition 
reflects the student’s very diverse reactions 
and interpretations of traveling and experienc-
ing the Italian culture, landscape, architecture 
and historical and contemporary works of art. 
Artists include: Katy Butler, Adrienne Lichliter, 
Joel Murray and Aubree Ross. The exhibition 
was organized by Lee Gallery. Hours: Mon.-
Fri., 8:30am-4:30pm. Contact: call Denise 
Woodward-Detrich, Lee Gallery Director at 
864/656-3883 or at (http://www.clemson.edu/
centers-institutes/cva/galleries/index.html).

Madren Conference Center, Clemson Univer-
sity, Clemson. Ongoing - Featuring wood and 
steel bird carvings by Grainger McKoy. Hours: 
regular building hours. Contact: Peter Kent at 
864/656-0382 or e-mail at (peter.kent@clem-
sonews.clemson.edu). 
 
The Fran Hanson Discovery Center, South 
Carolina Botanical Garden, Clemson University, 
Clemson. Featured Artists Gallery, Ongo-
ing - Featuring works by Nancy Basket, Sue 
Figliola, Sue Grier, Sandy King, Jo Ann Taylor 
and Phil Garrett, on a rotating basis. Elizabeth 
Belser Fuller Gallery, Ongoing - This collec-
tion of watercolors, mixed media and pen & ink 
drawings was generously donated by a dear 
friend of the SC Botanical Garden, Elizabeth 
Belser Fuller. This incredible collection ranges 
from 1947 to 1992. New pieces have been added 
this year in celebration of Belser's 97th birthday. 
Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-4pm. Closed University 
Holidays and Home Football Game Saturdays. 
Contact: 864/656-3405 or at (www.clemson.edu/
scbg/).

Columbia Area

and culture in South Carolina, is proud to exhibit 
their second art show, ¡FUERZA! (Spanish for 
strength, force, and power), featuring 12 graphic 
novel-style panels. ¡Fuerza! visually explores the 
connections between domestic violence and the 
underrepresented minorities in the United States 
through the lenses of a cadre of Latin@ artists 
based in South Carolina. Collaborative work by 
Piensa Art Company’s artists, Dre López, Sammy 
López, and Robert Chambers, in association with 
artists Ashley Berendzen, Mariángeles Borghini, 
and Alejandro García Lemos. Wells Fargo Edu-
cation Gallery, Oct. 15 - Jan. 7, 2015 - "Rock-
well Rocks!".  The CMA presents an exhibition of 
South Carolina student art from around the state. 
Students explore the processes and techniques 
used by Norman Rockwell to create their own 
work capturing their personal histories. BB&T 
Focus Gallery, Ongoing - "Southern Traditions," 
will showcase the richness and diversity of the 
Museum’s collection of furniture, ceramics, silver, 
basketry, sculpture and paintings by artists native 
to, or active in, South Carolina and its surround-
ing states. Among the works on view will be fine 
silver made by Charleston and Columbia silver-
smiths; a sweet grass basket by Mary Jackson 
(SC, born 1945); wood carvings by Edgar Alexan-
der McKillop (NC, 1879-1950); and paintings 
by Charles Fraser (SC, 1782-1860), Xanthus 
Russell Smith (SC, 1839-1929), William Harrison 
Scarborough (SC, 1812-1871), William Aiken 
Walker (SC, 1838-1921), among others. Galler-
ies 5 & 6, Ongoing - "Modern & Contemporary 
Art from the Collection". Celebrating some of the 
CMA’s greatest hits, this exhibition features over 
30 paintings, drawings, photographs and sculp-
tures from the Museum’s collection that have not 
been on view recently. It offers the visitor experi-
ences both serious and sensual and is designed 
to both entertain and enlighten. Notable works 
included are by Jasper Johns, Howard Thomas, 
Sally Mann and Edward Ruscha, whose famous 
image of the Hollywood Hills (on view) has 
become a staple of the art world. Ray Taylor Fair 
Gallery, Ongoing - Featuring a new and perma-
nent installation of its ancient art collection. The 
installation includes approximately 50 objects 
that introduce the major ancient civilizations from 
the Mediterranean and Near East. Examples of 
the earliest form of writing from 12th century B.C. 
Mesopotamia, are shown next to Egyptian scar-
abs and Greek painted vessels. The world of the 
ancient Romans is represented by 2nd century 
glass and bronze items and portrait sculpture. 
Many of these works have not been seen since 
the Museum moved to its location on Main Street 
in 1998. The collection has grown over the last 
several years with the donation of 12 fine Roman 
sculptures in 2002 from Pennsylvania collector 
Dr. Robert Y. Turner. Admission: Yes, but there 
is no admission charge on Sun. Hours: Tue.-Fri., 
11am-5pm; first Fri., till 8pm; Sat., 10am-5pm & 
Sun., noon-5pm. Contact: 803/799-2810 or at 
(www.columbiamuseum.org).

a specific theme or tradition. The South is home 
to a wide variety of deeply-rooted Native Ameri-
can tribal groups, each with their own dynamic 
history. The exhibition pays particular attention to 
five primary culture groups: Iroquoian, Muskoge-
an, Algonquin, Mobilian and Siouan. Within these 
culture groups and spanning nine states, the 
traditions of a variety of tribes will be explored, 
including the Cherokee, Edisto, Choctaw, 
Catawba, Chickasaw, Seminole, Chitimacha, 
Pamunkey, Wassamasaw and Creek. Featuring 
the work of master artists within these communi-
ties, the exhibition explores how these artists are 
influenced by the world around them and how 
they influence their native communities through 
leadership and a dynamic sense of cultural 
identity. Ongoing - "Diverse Voices: Discovering 
Community Through Traditional Arts". Dedicated 
to the late George D. Terry, "Diverse Voices" 
explores deeply-rooted traditions that help create 
and maintain the cultural landscape of South 
Carolina and the surrounding region. Each year 
the exhibit will focus on a specific theme or 
tradition. Year one of "Diverse Voices" offers a 
comprehensive presentation of objects from the 
museum collection that represent the work of 
celebrated NEA National Heritage Fellows and 
Jean Laney Harris Folk Heritage Award recipi-
ents. Ongoing - "Highlights from the Permanent 
Collections of McKissick Museum". Permanent 
- "Baruch Silver Collection," a collection of the 
Baruch family silver. And, "Natural Curiosity: USC 
and the Evolution of Scientific Inquiry into the 
Natural World".  Hours: Mon.-Fri., 8:30am-5pm 
& Sat., 11am-3pm. Contact: 803/777-7251 or at 
(http://artsandsciences.sc.edu/mcks/). 

McMaster Gallery, room 119, basement level, 
McMaster Building, 1615 Senate Street, Univer-
sity of South Carolina, corner of Pickens & Sen-
ate Streets, Columbia. Through Oct. 4 - "PATH-
WAYS: Photography Invitational". The exhibition 
that explores historical photographic methods 
in use today. The photographers included have 
rediscovered some of the forgotten early pro-
cesses, bringing a distinctive style to present-day 
image making. Incorporating methods such as 
tintype, palladium, gum bichromate, and col-
lodion into their work involves both skill and a 
creative blending of new and old. Artist included 
in this exhibition are: Anne Berry, Diana Bloom-
field, Carolyn DeMeritt, Christine Eadie, Frank 
Hamrick, Aspen Hochhalter, Kevin Bruce Parent, 
Emma Powell, Laurie Schorr, and S. Gayle Ste-
vens. Oct. 16 - Dec. 16 - "CephalicUS: A head 
of indecision," featuring paintings by Dan Smith. 
A reception will be held on Oct. 16, from 5-7pm. 
Smith earned his MFA degree in Painting from 
the University of South Carolina in 1991. The hu-
man face has been a favorite subject Smith has 
examined utilizing a wide variety of styles and 
subjects during his artistic career. His McMaster’s 
exhibit includes large acrylic paintings incorporat-
ing a variety of iconic portraits. Integrated into 
this exhibition are montage-based labels that 
integrate Smith’s verse with T.S. Elliot’s “The 
Love Song of Alfred P. Prufrock”. Hours: Mon.-
Fri., 9am-4:30pm. Contact: Mana Hewitt, Gallery 
Director at 803/777-7480 or at (http://artsand-
sciences.sc.edu/art/mcmaster_gallery). 

Richland County Public Library, Gallery at 
Main,1431 Assembly St., Columbia. Through 
Jan. 5, 2015 - "All the In Between - My Story of 
Agnes," by Laurie B. McIntosh. An exhibition of 
paintings telling the cradle to grave story of a 
life well lived. Ongoing - Featuring 20 pieces of 
public art on permanent display. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 
9am-9pm; Sat, 9am-6pm; Sun, 2-6pm. Contact: 
803/988-0886 or at (www.richland.lib.sc.us).

701 Center for Contemporary Art, 701 Whaley 
St., Columbia. Main Gallery, Through Oct. 12 
- "James Busby, Winner of the 701 CCA Prize 
2012: Figure 8". Busby is among the state’s most 
successful artists, regularly selling out shows in 
New York and elsewhere. His superbly crafted, 
material-based, non-objective works of art are 
paintings and three-dimensional objects all at 
once. The Chapin, SC, artist and Rock Hill, SC, 
native sands layers of gesso to create refined, 
smooth surfaces, then applies graphite, acrylics 
and oils. Oct. 30 - Dec. 21 - "701 CCA Prize 2014 
Finalists Exhibition," featuring works by Andrew 
Blanchard, Spartanburg; Shannon Lindsey, 
Columbia; and Karen Ann Myers, Charleston. 
A reception will be held on Oct. 30, from 7-9pm. 
The 701 CCA Prize 2014 is a competition and 
exhibition for South Carolina artists 40 years and 
younger. The winner of the 701 CCA Prize 2014 
will be announced during a 701 CCA Prize 2014 
Celebration event on Wednesday, Dec. 3, from 
7-10pm. This year’s Prize is the second install-
ment of the biennial event. West side of the 
701 Whaley building, Ongoing - "Herb Parker: 
Olympia Dialogue," featuring an outdoor, archi-
tectural installation by Charleston, SC, artist Herb 
Parker. His architectural structure is 10 feet tall, 
34 feet long and 18 feet wide and made of rebar, 
oat straw, jute, bamboo, reed and mulch. Parker 
created the work during his May residency at 701 
CCA with several volunteer assistants. "Olympia 
Dialogue" is 701 CCA’s first commissioned public 
art work. Hours: Wed., 11am-8pm; Thur.-Sat., 
11am-5pm & Sun., 1-5pm. Contact: 803/238-

2351 or at (www.701cca.org). 

SC State Museum, 301 Gervais St., Columbia. 
Through Jan. 18 - "Chapman’s Charleston, 
1863-1864," which tells the story of the Civil 
War in Charleston from 1863-1864 through the 
eyes of artist and Confederate soldier, Conrad 
Wise Chapman. The 33 original Chapman 
paintings, shown for the first time in Columbia, 
will examine art during the Civil War, the military 
defenses of Charleston against the Union siege 
and other artists who worked in the city during 
the war. Through 2015 - "The Coming of the 
Civil War," will look at the origins of the disagree-
ment between South Carolina and the federal 
government, beginning with the nullification crisis 
of 1832-33. The exhibit will be augmented by five 
more single-topic exhibits through the sesquicen-
tennial war years (2011-2015) until the expansion 
space is filled. Lipscomb Gallery, Through 
Mar. 16, 2015 - "Building a Universe," features 
creations by artists whose work deals with space 
and the universe, either directly or conceptually, 
according to Chief Curator of Art Paul Matheny. 
The works represent a wide variety of media, 
including installation art, painting, printmaking, 
collage, sculpture and mixed media work. In 
addition, installation art by Jocelyn Chateauvert, 
Virginia Scotchie and Jonathan Brilliant will be 
seen, as will the work of mixed media artists, 
painters and the final collage constructions of 
the late, world-renowned Robert Courtright of 
Sumter, created shortly before his death in late 
2012.” Participating artists included are: Jonathan 
Brilliant, Paul Martyka, Molly B. Right, Robert 
Courtright (1926-2012), Enid Williams, Peggy 
Rivers, Hollis Brown Thornton, Jocelyn Chateau-
vert, John Acorn, Aldwyth, Virginia Scotchie, Jon 
Prichard, Mary Edna Fraser, Greg Fitzpatrick, 
Kirkland Smith, and Gene Speer. The Crescent 
Café, second floor mezzanine of the Museum. 
The house menu offers a variety of baked goods, 
juices, coffee, hot chocolate and tea. Lunchtime 
offerings include deli sandwiches and alternat-
ing daily soups, as well as grilled chicken salads 
and sandwiches. And let’s not forget the house 
specialty: spectacular fudge, handmade on-site. 
Museum Hours: Mon.-Sat., 10am-5pm ; Sun.,1-
5pm. Admission: Yes. Contact: call 803/898-4921 
or at (http://scmuseum.org/).

     ALTERNATE ART SPACES - Columbia area
Columbia Metropolitan Airport, 3250 Airport 
Boulevard in West Columbia. 3D Showcases, 
Through Oct. 31 -  from Saturday, August 30 
through Friday, October 31st 2014. It’s About 
Time, a solo exhibition of found art objects by 
Columbia artist Susan Lenz  Lenz’s work will 
include "Time Signatures", a sculptural piece 
made from clock parts, piano keys, dominos, 
beer caps, and assorted common materi-
als. Hours: lobby is open twenty-four hours a 
day, seven days a week.  Contact: call Lynne 
Douglas, Air Service Development & Customer 
Service Manager at 803/822-5020. 

Columbia Metropolitan Convention Center, 
1101 Lincoln St., Columbia. Ongoing - Fea-
turing works by local artists throughout the 
convention center, including works by Mike Wil-
liams, Liisa Salosaari Jasinski, Tyrone Geter, 
Peter Lenzo, Jamie Davis, Tom Lockart & Mark 
Woodham, Angela Bradburn, Virginia Scotchie, 
Denise Dent, Sue Grier, Brian Rego, Heather 
LaHaise, Howard Hunt, Robert Campbell, 
Ernest Lee, David J.P. Hooker, Ralph Waldrop, 
Elena Madden, Debbie Martin, Blue Sky, Laura 
Spong, Jean McWhorter, Claire Farrell, Justin 
Guy, and Jonathan Green. Hours: Mon.-Fri., 
9am-5pm; Sat., 10am-4pm & Sun., 1-5pm. 
Contact: 803/545-0001 or at (www.columbia-
conventioncenter.com/phototour/phototour/).

Conway

“Prom” by Norman Rockwell

Columbia Museum of Art, Main & Hampton 
Streets, Columbia. Lipscomb Family Galler-
ies, Oct. 17 - Jan. 18, 2015 - "Norman Rock-
well: Behind the Camera". The CMA presents 
a landmark exhibition of the most famous and 
beloved of American illustrators. This is the first 
exhibition to explore in-depth Rockwell’s richly 
detailed study photographs, created by the artist 
as references for his iconic paintings. Rockwell is 
known for his depictions of everyday life created 
with humor, skill, and emotion. However, it is little 
known that he staged photographs to make his 
popular covers of the Saturday Evening Post. 
The exhibit includes 50 photographs that show 
the careful procedure Rockwell used to make his 
art, as well as 16 original paintings and drawings, 
and takes viewers behind the scenes in the cre-
ative process of one of America’s great masters. 
Mamie and William Andrew Treadway, Jr. 
Gallery 15, Through Jan. 4, 2015 - "Tabletop 
Art History: Still Life from the Collection". This 
intimate and colorful exhibition uses 24 still life 
paintings from the CMA collection, including 
works by Roy Lichtenstein, Julie Heffernan, and 
Lionel Gilbert, to tell the story of American art. 
From polished photographic apples, to loosely, 
but lovingly, painted bowls on the kitchen table, 
Tabletop Art History offers the opportunity to see 
how artists can use one theme in many different 
styles. Along the way, we also learn the difference 
between realism, impressionism, and expres-
sionism. Arrangements on a tabletop remain 
fascinating to artists who use everyday objects to 
create wildly varied images. Caroline Guignard 
Community Gallery, Through Nov.30 - "¡FUER-
ZA! Artistas Latin@s in South Carolina". As part 
of the Latin@ Month celebration, Palmetto LUNA, 
a non-profit organization promoting Latin@ arts 

“By The Gate,” by Eileen Blyth

“The Big Red,” by Laura Spong
Goodall Gallery, Spears Music/Art Center, 
Columbia College, 1301 Columbia College Drive, 
Columbia. Through Oct. 13 - "The Big Paint: 
New Works by Eileen Blyth and Laura Spong". 
A reception and gallery talk will be held on Sept. 
2, from 4-6pm. The exhibition features large-
scale mixed media paintings by Columbia based 
artists, Eileen Blyth and Laura Spong. Hours: 
Mon.-Wed., 10am-6pm; Thur.-Fri., 10am-7pm; 
and Sat.-Sun., 1-5pm. Contact: call Rebecca B. 
Munnerlyn at 803/786.3649 or e-mail at 
(rbmunnerlyn@colacoll.edu).

McKissick Museum, University of South Caroli-
na, USC Horseshoe, Columbia. 2nd floor South 
Gallery, Through July 25, 2015 - "Traditions, 
Change, and Celebration: Native Artists of the 
Southeast". The exhibit be on view in conjunc-
tion with the 2nd Annual FOLKFabulous festival 
on August 23, 2014, from 10am-4pm in front of 
the Museum on USC’s historic horseshoe. This 
exhibition represents year two of McKissick’s 
"Diverse Voices" series, which explores the vi-
brant traditions that help create and maintain the 
cultural landscape of South Carolina and the sur-
rounding region. Each year the exhibit focuses on 

Work by Diana Farfan
The Rebecca Randall Bryan Art Gallery, 
located in the Thomas W. and Robin W. Edwards 
College of Humanities and Fine Arts Building, 
Coastal Carolina University, Conway. Through 

http://www.701cca.org/
Mailto:rbmunnerlyn@colacoll.edu

